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BUNKER SURVEYS  
 

 

OPERATIONAL EXCELLENCE 
At ROCKLEDGE– the Marine & Technical Surveys dept. constantly striving 

for operational excellence in all our undertaking. This is not only reflected 

in how we conduct every- day business, but also embedded in our DNA. 

Our Bunker Surveyors are steadfast and understand the complexity and 

tricks of bunker surveys. We are strategically positioned to maintain high 

efficiency exceeding customer’s demands by adhering to acceptable CODE 

OF PRACTICE FOR BUNKER SURVEYING. Predominantly, BUNKER 

LOSSES has been a perennial problem affecting SHIPPING LINES, 

CHARTERERS & VESSEL OWNERS. Whereas, it might be attributable to 

varied factors, our team narrows down investigation to each factor with a 

view to understand the circumstances. Based on our widespread 

knowledge backed with years of experience, we have gained acceptance 

and credibility among our varied clientele in Shipping and Marine industry. 

 

WHAT’S IN IT FOR YOU? 
You’ll benefit from our team of Specialists’ Bunker surveyors available 

24/7/365 and understand the technical know-how and we’ll advise you 

accordingly. Over the years, our teams’ been able to recover tones of 

concealed fuels and averted numerous cappuccino effects saving 

charterers and owners millions of dollars. 

Bunker fuel quality analysis is paramount in every operation; we are aware 

of the dangers associated with fuel mixing especially when the batches are 

incompatible. To mitigate this, we have invested in Fuel Compatibility 

Analyzer giving us real time results (Compatibility+Stability) of the blended 

fuels even as the bunker transfer is ongoing.  

Our specialists’ will also be giving you real time updates on the progress of 

the operation at the comfort of your office/houses even when thousands of 

miles away from the actual exercise. 

WHO ARE WE? 
We are a team of Marine and 

Bunker Surveyors based in 

Mombasa with operation and 

offices in East Africa region. With a 

combined experience of more than 

20yrs,  our surveyors are able to 

respond to any assignment within 

short notice due to our close 

proximity to port facilities. We are 

licensed by the Kenya Ports 

Authority as Marine Surveyors. We 

have specialized ourselves in 

conducting surveys including BQS, 

BIS, ROB, Sludge Surveys, On/Off 

Hire among others.  

 

WHAT DO WE DO? 
We believe for Bunker Surveys to 
be effective, parties involved need 
to embrace a holistic approach and 
join efforts to increase accuracy. 
Three key components aid us in 
accomplishing our missions. 

Scope Definition, Intervention, 
Transparent reporting. We act as 
the impartial,  independent and 
trusted third party to provide the 
necessary comfort and service 
levels for our principals. 

Scope definition; The Scope and 
the Framework of the Inspection 
work as defined in the nomination 
by the client is agreed upon by 
ourselves. The requirements are 
considered as the minimum steps 
to be taken when undertaking 
condition surveys. 

Intervention; Our work 
instructions forms the basis and 
guides how our objectives/ mission 
will be accomplished.  

Transparent Reporting; In 
addition to our regular updates, we 
furnish our clients with a detailed 
survey reports. 
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